
BID OPENING DATE:  09/05/19 BID NUMBER: 13303

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL  SUPPLIES

SIGNATURES:

COMPANY NAME

CONTACT

PHONE

FAX

EMAIL

ITEM QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 60 gal $1.38 $82.80 $2.47 $148.20 no bid no bid

2 1 ea $1.54 $1.54 $3.15 $3.15 no bid no bid

3 1 ea $5.81 $5.81 $10.63 $10.63 $7.70 $7.70

4 1 ea $15.60 $15.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid

5 1 ea $2.24 $2.24 no bid no bid no bid no bid

6 30 ea $2.60 $78.00 $17.99 $539.70 $4.01 $120.30

7 5 gal $12.87 $64.35 $16.37 $81.85 $56.16 $280.80

8 5 ea $8.10 $40.50 $7.74 $38.70 no bid no bid

9 5 qt $1.47 $7.35 $1.66 $8.30 no bid no bid

INDUSTRIAL SOAP CO.

BID OPENING TIME:  2:00 PM

DESCRIPTION

X

X

OFFICE ESSENTIALS

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE X X X

X

X

BUCKEYE

CITY AND STATE

BID TABULATION

485-022-00001 Drain and Sewer Cleaner and 

Maintainer, drain, liquid opener, non-fuming 

action. 1 quart size

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-006-00001; Bleach, household. One 

gallon containers.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-020-00001 All Purpose Cleaner, spic & 

span, for use in general cleaning. 27 oz. box.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-010-00003 Broom, whisk, corn 10", three 

row stitching, metal capped

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-014-00001 Cleaner, hand, pumice gel, 

waterless with applicator. 1 gallon 

container. Fast Orange or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-012-00001 Polish, Metal, clean silver & 

metal. SP6290 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-010-00015 Brush, Wire, Long handle, 

Wood block. Length 12 1/2", wire 6" long, 1 

1/8" trim, 3 tufts in length. Fed spec. HB-

175B

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-010-00013 Broom, red fiber, prime 

broom, industrial heavy duty fiber, 

steelhead, with one wire band.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485 -010-00005 Broom, warehouse, corn 

body 12"-14", length 17"-18", 5 ties.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________



10 50 qt $1.25 $62.50 $2.15 $107.50 $3.56 $178.00

11 5 gal $2.77 $13.85 $8.47 $42.35 $6.39 $31.95

12 4 ea $0.62 $2.48 $0.96 $3.84 no bid no bid

13 300 ea $1.38 $414.00 $1.70 $510.00 $1.34 $402.00

14 5 ea $10.92 $54.60 $10.30 $51.50 $3.30 $16.50

15 60 ea $1.84 $110.40 $4.86 $291.60 no bid no bid

16 36 ea $2.29 $82.44 $4.04 $145.44 no bid no bid

17 100 gal $7.22 $722.00 $16.99 $1,699.00 no bid no bid

18 20 ea $3.38 $67.60 $3.53 $70.60 no bid no bid

19 3 ea $4.77 $14.31 $6.88 $20.64 no bid no bid

20 90 ea $4.25 $382.50 $5.10 $459.00 $3.50 $315.00

485-038-00001 Liquid Dish Soap. 30 oz. or 32 

oz. Bottles. 12/cs. Rise & Shine, Sweetheart, 

Dawn or equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-030-00002 Deodorant Round for Urinals.  

30-day Air Freshener with Indicator Tab. 

1/pkg w/ screen saver bag. Wave2.0 or equal. 

Enzyme Apple, MANGO, CUCUMBER 

MELON Replacement. RLURINAL-APPLE 

RLURINAL-ORG, RLURINAL-FRESH or 

equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-029-00001 Cleanser, powder, industrial 

strength with chlorine bleach. Clorox or Ajax 

or equal. 14 oz. or 21 oz. cans.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-028-00001 Cleaner, glass, window, spray 

on-wipe off, liquid institutional grade. 

Windex or equal. One gallon bottles.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-026-00001 Cleaner, toilet bowl, liquid, 

containing at least 10% hydrogen chloride 

w/emulsions & inhibitors. Removes Odor, 

Rust & Scale. Bovex #9796 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-070-00002 Mop. Wet Mop Head. White 

Cotton Twin Yarn. 24oz. 8 ply. 1.25” Hand-

Sewn. No Roving Yarns.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-070-00001 Mop Handle with Metal 

Holder. 5’ wet or mop 63” long for 7” Heads. 

White No. 83 Speed Changer Mop Heads. 

Heavy Electroplated. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-060-00002 Wasp & Hornet Spray. 12oz 

Aerosol Cans. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-042-00001 Disinfectant, Pure Pine Oil. 

No Synthetics. 5& Phenol Coefficiency. 5 

A.O.A.C. Method. 90& Active Ingredients. 1 

gal. 4/cs.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-040-00001 Disinfectant Deodorizer. 

Aerosol Sprayer. Eliminates Odor and kills 

staph and strep germs, influenza virus, 

prevents mold & mildew. 15.5oz cans. 

IMPACT or equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-032-00001 Deodorant. Air Freshener. 7oz 

Can. 12/cs. Microburst 9000. 1931-SeaMist. 

1932-Dutch Apple/Spice. RMFG4012441. Or 

Equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________



21 5 ea $7.20 $36.00 $6.77 $33.85 no bid no bid

22 25 ea $0.50 $12.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid

23 1 ea $6.22 $6.22 $6.62 $6.62 no bid no bid

24 65 gal $5.60 $364.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

25 1 ea $18.20 $18.20 no bid no bid no bid no bid

26 1 ea $16.00 $16.00 no bid no bid $12.70 $12.70

27 1 ea $16.00 $16.00 no bid no bid $12.95 $12.95

28 1 ea $12.00 $12.00 $11.43 $11.43 $10.75 $10.75

29 1 ea $43.25 $43.25 $43.60 $43.60 $37.20 $37.20

30 4 ea $3.92 $15.68 $3.76 $15.04 $4.31 $17.24

31 15 cs $29.40 $441.00 $75.00 $1,125.00 no bid no bid

32 12 cs $77.40 $928.80 $78.09 $937.08 no bid no bid

485-086-00005 Liquid Hand Soap. Antiseptic 

Lotion Concentrated. 1 gal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-086-00003 Hand Soap. Powder with 

Lanolin. Pink. 5lb box. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-086-00002 Hand Soap, Lave, Pumice. 

4.5oz unwrapped bars.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-070-00003 Mop. Wet Mop Head. White 

Cotton Twin Yarn. 32oz. 8 ply. 1.25” Hand-

Sewn. No Roving Yarns.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

JW Spitfire Power Cleaner 32oz RTU Spray. 

JW95891789or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

GJ Purell Es Hand Sanitizer Gel Refill 450ml. 

GJ1450-06 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

GJ Purell Es System Starter Kit. GJ1450-EA 

or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

20” Rear Linatex Squeegee T3 T5. 

TN1011456 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

20” Front Linatex Squeegee T3 T5. 

TN1011232 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-088-00004 Squeegee with Handle. 24” 

Heavy Duty. 1/8” x 1” Angle Iron. ¼” x 2” 

Read Gum Rubber Blade. 60” x 1-1/8” Wood 

Handle.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

PG TIDE Pods Laundry Detergent Spring 

Meadow. PG50978 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

PG Cascade Auto Dishwasher Machine 

Action Pacs 6ea/cs. PG94542 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________



33 5 cs $45.65 $228.25 $44.81 $224.05 no bid no bid

34 3 cs $22.00 $117.00 $28.46 $85.38 $37.92 $113.76

35 11 cs $36.90 $405.90 $41.46 $456.06 $39.50 $434.50

36 8 ea $53.25 $426.00 no bid no bid $49.45 $395.60

37 4 cs $28.08 $112.32 $53.02 $212.08 $56.92 $227.68

38 6 ea $9.35 $56.10 $15.48 $92.88 $11.20 $67.20

39 2 bx $12.88 $25.76 $11.86 $23.72 $35.20 $70.40

40 1 ea $0.40 $0.40 no bid no bid $0.55 $0.55

41 1 ea $1.95 $1.95 no bid no bid no bid no bid

42 3 pk $12.50 $37.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid

43 1 pk $6.95 $6.95 no bid no bid no bid no bid

PG BOUNCE Fabric Softener Dryer Sheets 

6/160ct. PG80168 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

485-088-00003

Medium Duty Scour Pad Sponge. 

RL74 or #9030 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Premium Blend Canvas Back Dust Mop 

Refill 5 x 48 4P RPPL. RL5X48DUSTMOP or 

equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Spartan Peroxy II FBC Foaming Bath & 

Surface Cleaner 32oz. SP3535 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Spartan Extreme Custom Car Wash And Wax 

5 gal. SP2671-5 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

• Please provide Sample at time of Bid 

Opening

Ammoniated RTU Glass Cleaner 32oz RPPL. 

RL3000-12 or Ricmar Brite or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

PT Upright Microlined Paper Filter Bag, 

10/pk. PT103483 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Janitized ST Filter Bag, 3/pk. JZ-EUST3-

3PKG or equal

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

10" Chem Resistant Premium Trigger 

Sprayer Blue/Yellow. RL-

PREMCRTRIGSPRAY or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

10" BL/WH Trigger Sprayer. RL-TRIG-SPRAY 

or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

RP 4.09 x 3.75 2ply Roll Tissue 500sht EFP 

RPPL.  RPTP-2-PREM or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

• Please provide Sample at time of Bid 

Opening



44 1 cs $27.70 $27.70 $16.68 $16.68 $3.07 $3.07

45 1 cs $12.35 $12.35 $15.72 $15.72 $3.07 $3.07

46 1 cs $8.25 $99.00 $6.62 $6.62 $8.90 $8.90

47 1 ea $232.30 $232.30 $231.09 $231.09 no bid no bid

48 1 ea $11.00 $11.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

49 32 gal $13.65 $436.80 no bid no bid $18.06 $577.92

50 16 gal $8.70 $139.20 $15.66 $250.56 $14.26 $228.16

51 4 ea $10.34 $41.36 $26.34 $105.36 no bid no bid

52 5 ea $71.44 $357.20 $73.83 $369.15 $82.24 $411.20

53 5 ea $1.85 $9.25 $3.22 $16.10 no bid no bid

Partial Response Partial Response

$6,921.51 $8,510.07 $3,985.10Total

Notes

485-080-00002 Foaming Aerosol Cleaner, 

Germicidial Can, 18oz., Spray & Wipe, No 

Rinse, Betco GC/88 Cide-Bet, SP6081 or 

equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

I-Shine Floor Finish. 5 gal. SP4055-5 or 

equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Toilet/Urinal Auto Flush Clamp On. 

RMFG401805A or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Microfiber 18oz Tube Wet Mop. 

RLMFTUBE18-BL or equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

20” Thick WH Polish Floor Pad. RL-

WHPOLISH20 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

20” Tan UHS Burnish Floor Pad. RL-TANUHS-

20 or equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Green Solutions Neutral Disinfectant 

Cleaner. 2 ltr. #105. SP3515 or equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Green Solutions Neutral Disinfectant 

Cleaner. 1 gal. SP3502 or equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

Clean By PeroxyA/P Hydrogen Peroxide 

Cleaner. EFP. SP0035 or equal. 

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________

• Please provide Sample at time of Bid 

Opening

Handle Socket Assembly. SN36648A-2SV or 

equal.

Manufacturer: _____________________

Qty Per Pkg:  _____________________

Pkg per Cs:  _____________________


